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Response to Request for Information

Reference FOI 091528
Date 07 September 2015

Schools

Request and response in ‘blue’:

Please find below a request for information under the Freedom of Information Act.

Information requested:

1. In each of the last five years, how many local authority maintained schools
were there in your local authority?
a. 2010/11 – 103 school
b. 2011/12 – 101 schools
c. 2012/13 – 91 schools
d. 2013/14 – 86 schools
e. 2014/15 – 80 schools
Please note that supplied figures relate to the position at the end of each
academic year.

2. What has been the budget (£) for the Educational Welfare Service in your local
authority for each of the last five years?
a. 2010/11 - Information not held
b. 2011/12 - £454,000
c. 2012/13 - £545,000
d. 2013/14 - £558,000
e. 2014/15 - £584,000

3. What is the budget (£) for the Educational Welfare Service in your local
authority for 2015/16? £606,000

4. How much money (£) has your local authority spent on the provision of
parenting courses in each of the last five years?
a. 2010/11
b. 2011/12
c. 2012/13
d. 2013/14
e. 2014/15
Information not held
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5. How many pupils are estimated to be eligible for Pupil Premium in your local
authority?
Maintained Academies Total
9,809.00 3,426.00 13,235.00

6. How many pupils are registered for pupil premium in your local authority?
Maintained Academies Total
10,116.00 3,529.50 13,645.50

7. What was the total estimated pupil premium funding (£) for schools in your local
authority for 2014/15 academic year?
Maintained Academies Total
£11,759,265 £3,487,280 £15,246,545

8. How much funding (£) did schools in your local authority actually receive in
pupil premium funding in 2014/15 academic year?
Maintained Academies Total

(direct from EFA)
£13,009,230 £3,640,103 £16,649,333

Please note this information is the 2014-15 financial year, not academic year. The allocations made
are financial year based.


