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Response to Request for Information 

 
Reference FOI 002804 
Date 25 September 2018 
 

Traffic Management Measures 

 
Request: 
1)  The number of speed bumps, and other similar traffic management measures 

(including but not limited to speed tables, junction tables, round top road 
humps, entry treatments such as rumble devices, speed cushions and road 
narrowing) installed. If a time period is required, please may it be over the 
previous 10 years. 
In respect of question 1), it has been established after careful consideration that 
the Council does not hold the above information.  
 
Consequently, we are unable to provide any information relating to the above, 
and are informing you as required by Section 1(1) (a) of the Act, that states:  
 
"Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled to 
be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the 
description specified in the request".  

 
2)  The number of ongoing and completed road works or maintenance over the 

past 10 years (broken down by year.) 
 In answer to question 2, please see attached.  Please note the information 

provided is focused on major carriageway maintenance works only. 
 
3)  The number of one way systems. If a time period is required, please may it be 

over the previous 10 years. 
In respect of question 3), it has been established after careful consideration that 
the Council does not hold the above information.  
 
Consequently, we are unable to provide any information relating to the above, 
and are informing you as required by Section 1(1) (a) of the Act, that states:  
 
"Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled to 
be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the 
description specified in the request".  

 
 In the following locations: 

City of Wolverhampton 
 
If possible please may I have the total (or estimated) number of installations of 
these measures 
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Works Year Site Name - unless stated otherwise assume treatment applied to whole site Treatment

2007-08 Wobaston Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2007-08 Ettingshall Road - Bilston Road to Parkfield Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2007-08 Bushbury Lane - Underhill Lane Junction Carriageway Major Maintenance

2007-08 Castlecroft Road - Windsor Gardens to Castlecroft Avenue Carriageway Major Maintenance

2007-08 Third Avenue - Fifth Avenue Island Carriageway Major Maintenance

2007-08 Kempthorne Avenue - Hammond Avenue Island Carriageway Major Maintenance

2008-09 Ring Road St Patricks - Stafford Street Junction Carriageway Major Maintenance

2008-09 Merridale Road - Finchfield Road to Compton Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2008-09 Wergs Road Phase 1 - The Rock to Wrottesley Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2008-09 Wergs Road Phase 2 - Wrottesley Road Wergs Hall Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2008-09 Castlecroft Road - Phase 1 - Firs Pub to The Avenue Carriageway Major Maintenance

2008-09 Castlecroft Road - Phase 2 - The Avenue to Oak Hill Carriageway Major Maintenance

2008-09 Castlecroft Road - Phase 3 - Oak Hill to Finchfield Road West Carriageway Major Maintenance

2008-09 Stafford Road - Goodyear Island Carriageway Major Maintenance

2008-09 Waterloo Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2008-09 Barnhurst Lane Carriageway Major Maintenance

2009-10 Lichfield Road - Lakefield Road Roundabout to Canal Carriageway Major Maintenance

2009-10 Wighwick Bank Carriageway Major Maintenance

2009-10 Legs Lane - Cromwell Road to Northycote Lane Carriageway Major Maintenance

2009-10 Thompson Avenue - Parkfield Road Junction Carriageway Major Maintenance

2009-10 Broad Street/Princes Square/Wulfruna Street Junction Carriageway Major Maintenance

2010-11 Wednesfield Road/Wolverhampton Road - Sun Street to Deans Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2010-11 Willenhall Road - Old Heath Crescent to Dean's Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2010-11 Birmingham New Road - Black Country Route to Meadow Lane (Phase I) Carriageway Major Maintenance

2011-12 PAGET ROAD Carriageway Major Maintenance

2011-12 Kempthorne Avenue - Hammond Avenue to Bushbury Lane Carriageway Major Maintenance

2011-12 Thompson Avenue - Napier Road to Parkfield Crescent Carriageway Major Maintenance

2011-12 Birmingham New Road - Spring Road to Black Country Route (Phase II) Carriageway Major Maintenance

2011-12 Horseley Fields/Middle Cross - Shakespeare Street to Mary Ann Street Carriageway Major Maintenance

2011-12 Dudley Road - Frederick Street Junction (Bus Lane) Carriageway Major Maintenance

2011-12 Wood End Road/Lichfield Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2011-12 Penn Road Outbound - Church Hill to Vicarage Road Carriageway Major Maintenance
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2011-12 Penn Road Inbound - Hollybush Lane to Church Hill Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Willenhall Road - The Keyway Roundabout Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Willenhall Road - Hickman Avenue Junction Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Willenhall Road - Neachells Lane Junction Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Legs Lane - Northycote Lane Junction Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Broad Street - Under Railway Bridge Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Willenhall Road - Deans Road Junction Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Bilston Road - Dual Carriageway Section Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Parkfield Road - Phase 2 - Windsor Road to Railway Bridge Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Parkfield Road - Phase 1 - Thompson Avenue to Windsor Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Linden Lea - Finchfield Road West to Walnut Drive Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Finchfield Road West - Coppice Road to Broad Lane Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Keepers Lane - No 17 to City Boundary Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Millfields Road - Stom Road to Village Way Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Manor Road - Under Railway Bridge Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 McLean Road - Front No 4 - Turning Circle Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Bilston Road - Culwick Street to Hargreaves Street Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Bilston Road / Wellington Road - Phase 2 - Wolverhampton Street to Texaco Petrol Station Carriageway Major Maintenance

2012-13 Black Country Route - Sedgemoor Park Island to Spring Vale Island Carriageway Major Maintenance

2015-16 TETTENHALL ROAD/THE ROCK/LOWER STREET - junction Carriageway Major Maintenance

2015-16 COMPTON ROAD WEST - Finchfield Hill to Avenue Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2015-16 WINDMILL LANE Carriageway Major Maintenance

2015-16 KEMPTHORNE AVENUE/BUSHBURY LANE Carriageway Major Maintenance

2015-16 Garrick/Market Street Carriageway Major Maintenance

2015-16 Renton Road (less MAS cost £18,171.00) Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 Church Street/Bushbury Road /Tudor Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 Bushbury Lane Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 Bridgnorth Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 Waddensbrook Lane Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 Warstones Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 Bath Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 High Street, Wednesfield Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 Newhampton Road East Carriageway Major Maintenance
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2016-17 Penn Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 Prestwood Road West Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 Stafford Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 Ring Road St Andrews (Chapel Ash to Waterloo Road, northbound) Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 Ring Road St Peters (Waterloo Road to Stafford Street, eastbound) Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 OLD HEATH ROAD - 114 to 182 Carriageway Major Maintenance

2016-17 OLD HEATH ROAD - Deansfield Road to Willenhall Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 THREE TUNS LANE - Stafford Road to Fordhouse Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 COMPTON ROAD - Chapel Ash to Clark Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 PENN ROAD - Stubbs Road to Coalway Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 COALWAY ROAD - Trysull Road to Penn Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 CHAPEL ASH - Tettenhall Road to Ring Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 WARSTONES ROAD - Coalway Road to Billy Wright Close Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 TRYSULL ROAD - Wenlock Avenue to Bamber Close Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 BLACK COUNTRY ROUTE - Prosse Street to Oxford Street Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 Birmingham New Road - Spring Road to Parkfields Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 LOWER STREET - Grotto Lane to Tettenhall Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 MILLFIELDS ROAD - Union Street to Black Country Route Carriageway Major Maintenance

2017-18 BILSTON ROAD - Ring Road to Cullwick Street Carriageway Major Maintenance

2018-19 SALOP STREET - Loxdale Street to Baldwin Street Carriageway Major Maintenance

2018-19 BLACK COUNTRY ROUTE - Oxford Street Island to Prosser Street Carriageway Major Maintenance

2018-19 BIRMINGHAM NEW ROAD - Parkfield Rd to Spring Rd - Outbound Carriageway Major Maintenance

2018-19 CHESTERTON ROAD - Dickens Road to Cannock Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2018-19 DICKENS ROAD - Chesterton Road to Tennyson Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2018-19 RANELAGH ROAD - Dudley Road to Haggard Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2018-19 THE CRESCENT - Broad Street to Wellington Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2018-19 CANNOCK ISLAND - All Island Carriageway Major Maintenance

2018-19 HIGHFIELDS ROAD - Dudley Street to Bankfield Road Carriageway Major Maintenance

2018-19 BROAD LANES - MTC to Gills Butchers Carriageway Major Maintenance

2018-19 ASH STREET - Highfields Road to Daisy Street Carriageway Major Maintenance


