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CITY or

WOLVERHAMPTON
COUNCIL

Response to Request for Information

Reference FOI 002794
Date 24 September 2018

Older People’s Care Survey
Request:

1. About you

Your personal details do not form part of the FOI request, however they are useful
for further inquiries about this survey.

Local Authority

Name

Job title

Phone number

2. Average and maximum prices

(i) Please provide the average and maximum prices of LA-funded places
and the average prices of self-funded places for older people. If you do
not have exact figures for this group, please provide your closest
approximations based on your available data, such as your market
position statements. E.g. “between £650 and £700 a week” or “approx.

£675".
LA-funded Self-funded
Average price | Maximum Average price
per place price per per place
place

Care home (£/week) £454 £753 -

Care home with dementia support £488 £3.135 i

(£/week)

Nursing home (£/week) (after

Nursing home with dementia

support (£/week) (after FNC)* £555 £3,500 i

Extra care housing (£/week)** £185 £222

Home care (£/hour)

Excludes Rapid Response £14.52 £14.56
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* Please take into account reimbursements paid to settings through FNC (see
glossary), to reflect the actual price charged per individual place (ie. the

difference between the total amount received by a setting and reimbursements they
may receive through FNC).

** If you only have the hourly price of extra care housing, please provide the price for
the average number of hours of care used per week.

3. Number of individuals using services —

(i)

Please provide the number of older people using the following services
over a year (ie. the most recent 12-month period you hold data for).
Please use your closest approximations, if exact figures are

unavailable.

Number of individuals | Number of individuals
(LA-funded) (self-funded)

Care home 219

Care home with dementia support 521

Nursing home 207

Nursing home with dementia 193

support

Extra care housing 307

Home care 1,474

(ii)

Please provide the number of hours per year used by all older people
using home care services in total (ie. the most recent 12-month period
you hold data for). Please use your closest approximations, if exact

figures are unavailable.

LA-funded hours per
year

Self-funded hours per
year

Home care (hours per year)
Excludes Rapid Response

561,511
(Commissioned/
Planned Hours)
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4. Source of funding

(i)

What proportion of older people in receipt of social care in your area are
entirely LA-funded, partly LA-funded, or entirely self-funded? This
includes all kinds of social care referenced in our glossary at the
beginning of the survey. Please use your closest approximations, if
exact figures are unavailable.

Entirely LA- Partly LA- Entirely self-
funded funded funded

% % %

In respect of question 4 (i), it has been established after careful
consideration that the Council does not hold the above.

Consequently, we are unable to provide any information relating to the
above, and are informing you as required by Section 1(1) (a) of the Act,
that states:

"Any person making a request for information to a public authority is
entitled to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds
information of the description specified in the request".

What proportion of the places for older people in residential care (ie. care
homes and nursing homes) that you commission are funded using top-
ups from third parties (to any extent)? Please use your closest
approximations, if exact figures are unavailable.

Proportion of places paid for
with top-ups from third 22%
parties

5. Sufficiency of Services

(i)

Based on your latest market analysis, is there sufficient provision in your
area to meet the care needs of older people for the following services?
Please indicate with a cross (X).

Yes No Don’t Know

Care home X

Care home with dementia X

support

Nursing home X

Nursing home with dementia X

support

Extra care housing X

Home care X
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When did you most recently assess sufficiency?

commissioning function.

Sufficiency and Strategic Needs assessment is an ongoing activity as part of the

(i)  OPTIONAL: If you indicated ‘No’ or ‘Don’t Know’ for any answers, please

use the space below to tell us about the issues in your area. We are

grateful for any additional information.

6. Out of area placements

(i) Do you use out of area placements for older people’s care? (See glossary
for definition.) Please indicate with a cross (X).

Data not
Yes No held/inacces
sible

(ii) If so, what proportion of your total placements for older people’s care are
out of area? Please use your closest approximations if exact figures
are unavailable, or leave blank if the data is not held or not

accessible.

Proportion of provision sourced
from outside your local authority
area

8%

7. Future projections

(i) Do you expect the following to increase, decrease or stay the same over
the next year? Please indicate with a cross (X).

Stay Don'’t
Increase | Decrease | the
know
same
Demand for older people’s care X
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Supply of older people’s care X

Funding available per person
needing care

Thank you for completing this survey.
OPTIONAL: If you have any feedback on the survey or any additional comments,
lease use the space below, or contact Josh Cottell using the above contact details.




