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CITY or

WOLVERHAMPTON

COUNCIL

Response to Request for Information

Reference FOI 002261

Date

8 May 2018

Public Space Protection Orders

Request:

1.

Each offence recorded under the Public Spaces Protection Order since it was
enacted, including the date, the reason, the ethnicity of the offender and the
nationality of the offender. Please provide this data in an Excel spreadsheet.
In response to question 1 above, it has been established after careful
consideration that the Council does not hold all of the above information as
we do not record nationality and we only hold limited data on ethnicity.

Consequently, we are unable to provide all of the above information relating to
the above, and are informing you as required by Section 1(1) (a) of the Act, that
states:

"Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled to
be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the
description specified in the request".

However, the information we do hold is attached. Please also see the following
information which we hope will be of assistance.

Park Village PSPO

449 FPN’s issued of which 386 for littering cigarettes, 5 littering food, 58 other
litter, where ethnicity is known as follows:

IC1 white North European 383

IC2 white South European 20

IC3 Black 4

IC4 Asian (India, Pakistan, Bangladesh, Napal) 20
IC5 Chinese, Japanese or other South East Asian 1
IC6 Arabic or North African 6

IC9 Unknown 15

3 FPN’s for fly tipping no ethnicity or nationality data
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Low Hill PSPO

7 FPN’s issued all relating to caravans on the highway
11 September 2015 -1 FPN

20 January 2016 — 2 FPN

1 March 2016 — 1 FPN

15 March 2016 — 1 FPN

PSPO6 Sept 2016 — 2 FPN

17 August 2017 — 2 FPN

Dog Control PSPO
10 FPN Dog Fouling (see attached information)

Street Drinking PSPO
3 FPN failing to reply with request (see attached information)

A list of the types of PSPO currently active at the council, as well as any under
consideration.

Gating orders have now been replaced by PSPQO’s, the current list and details
are available if you follow the link below:

http://www.wolverhampton.gov.uk/article/3047/Public-Spaces-Protection-
Orders-replacing-Gating-orders

- Park Village and Low Hill PSPO’s
See attached document

- Dog Control PSPO text can be found if you follow the link below:
www.wolverhampton.gov.uk/CHttpHandler.ashx?id=14624&p=0

It was made by Cabinet 19 July 2017 and came into force 1 October 2017
(The date is on the Annexe on page 3 of the document on the link above)

- Drinking Control PSPO
See attached document

If the council is using private contractors to enforce PSPOs — stating the
company and relevant PSPO, as well as whether there is a financial incentive
to issue fines.

Kingdom Services Group

There is no financial incentive on the issuing of fines.


http://www.wolverhampton.gov.uk/article/3047/Public-Spaces-Protection-Orders-replacing-Gating-orders
http://www.wolverhampton.gov.uk/article/3047/Public-Spaces-Protection-Orders-replacing-Gating-orders
http://www.wolverhampton.gov.uk/CHttpHandler.ashx?id=14624&p=0
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WOLVERHAMPTON CITY COUNCI

Anti-social Behaviour, Crime and Policing Act 2014
WOLVERHAMPTON CITY COUNCIL
PUBLIC SPACES PROTECTION ORDER

(PUBLIC ALCOHOL CONSUMPTION AND ALCOHOL RELATED ANTI-SOCIAL
BEHAVIOUR)

Pursuant to section 59 Anti-social Behaviour, Crime and Policing Act 2014 and further
to the public consultation exercise (6 January to 17 February 2017) and the decision
of Wolverhampton City Council’s Cabinet on 22 February 2017,

WOLVERHAMPTON CITY COUNCIL makes the foliowing order:

1. The Wolverhampton City Council (Alcohol Consumption in Designated Public
Places) Order 2013 is hereby revoked.

2. Anywhere within the boundaries of the Wolverhampton City Council local
authority area Police Officers (including Police Community Support Officers)
are hereby authorised to require a person to stop drinking alcohol and surrender
any alcohol in their possession where anti-social behaviour is occurring, or in
the reasonable belief of the police officer, likely to occur. Any person who,
without reasonable excuse, fails to comply with a police officer's request
commits an offence and may be liable to prosecution.

3. The following exclusions apply to clause 2 above. This Public Spaces
Protection Order cannot be used to restrict the consumption of alcohol where
the premises or its curtilage (a beer garden or pavement seating area) is
licensed for the supply of alcohol. There are further limitations where either Part
5 of the Licensing Act 2003 or section 115E of the Highways Act 1980 as such
legislative provisions already provide safeguards against anti-social behaviour.

4. It is prohibited to consume alcohol in any public place anywhere within the
entirety of St Peter’s and Park Ward areas of the Wolverhampton City Council
local authority area. For the avoidance of doubt these areas inciude the City
Centre. This prohibition is subject to the limitations of clause 3 above.

5. Clause 4 above includes a waivering option to allow for public drinking at
organised events within the St Peter's and Park Ward areas where applications
for temporary event notices have been made to the Licensing Team of
Wolverhampton City Council and have been approved.



6. Failure to comply with the provisions set out herein, without reasonable excuse,
can result in fixed penalty notices being issued by -authorised officers of
Wolverhampton City Council or other persons designated by Wolverhampton
City Council. A penaity charge of £80 will be applicable in such circumstances.

7. This Order may be cited as Wolverhampton City Council Public Spaces
Protection (Public Alcohol Consumption and Alcohol Related Anti-Social
Behaviour) Order 2017 and shall come into force from 6 a.m. on 6 April 2017.

THE COMMON SEAL of Wolverhampton

City Council was hereunto affixed on this }
07 day of March 2017 in the presence of:
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