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CITY or

WOLVERHAMPTON
COUNCIL

Response to Request for Information

Reference FOI 001397
Date 07 August 2017

Health and Wellbeing

Request:

1. According to the National Drug Treatment Monitoring System (NDTMS), how
many opiate clients were in treatment between 315t March 2016 and 15t April
20177
There were 996 patients in treatment between 1st April 2016 and 31st March
2017

2. According to the Office for National Statistics (ONS) and/or Coroners statistics,
how many deaths related to drug poisoning (as defined by the International
Classification of Diseases, ICD-9 and ICD-10) were registered in 2015 where
any opioid was mentioned on the death certificate?

Unable to provide precise figures for 2015 but three year rolling average
available from the Office of National Statistics — Drug misuse deaths by local
authority or Coroners statistics 2015, both of which are in the public domain.

3. Is Take-home Naloxone (THN) currently provided? Yes

4. Was the term ‘Naloxone’ included in the most recent tender document when
commissioning for any drug and/or alcohol services? No

5.  Who is responsible for purchasing Naloxone? Please select all that apply:
Commissioned drug and alcohol service.

6. How many Naloxone kits were purchased by responsible persons/bodies (see
Question 5) in each financial year since 2014/15?

Between 1st April 2014 and 31st March 2015: City of Wolverhampton Council
do not hold this information.
Between 1st April 2015 and 31st March 2016: City of Wolverhampton Council
do not hold this information.
Between 1st April 2016 and 31st March 2017: City of Wolverhampton Council
do not hold this information.

7. Are there any concrete plans to repurchase Naloxone in the next financial year
(between 1st April 2017 and 31st March 2018)? Yes
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11.
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Who is currently directly providing Take-home Naloxone (THN) kits? Please
select all that apply: Commissioned Drug & Alcohol service

Have THN providers received training on how to train THN recipients to
administer Naloxone? Yes

a. Which groups received such training? Please select all that apply: Don’t
know; City of Wolverhampton Council do not hold this information.

b.  Which organisation(s) and/or individual(s) delivered such training? Please
select all that apply:

Other: Commissioned drug and alcohol service

Who is currently provided with THN kits? Please select all that apply:
People who use drugs;

Opiate Substitution Therapy (OST) patients;

Family member(s), friend(s) of and/or carers for at-risk individuals;

Do individuals eligible to receive THN kits (see Question 11) have to fulfil any
requirements in order to receive THN kits? Please select all that apply:
Completion of training on Naloxone administration delivered by a THN provider;

What is the maximum number of THN kits an individual can receive at the point
of access, if any?
Don’t know; City of Wolverhampton Council do not hold this information.

How many THN kits were dispensed in the community in each financial year
since 2014/15?

Between 1st April 2014 and 31st March 2015: City of Wolverhampton Council
do not hold this information.

Between 1st April 2015 and 31st March 2016: City of Wolverhampton Council
do not hold this information.

Between 1st April 2016 and 31st March 2017: City of Wolverhampton Council
do not hold this information.

What recording and/or monitoring practices have been put in place regarding
Naloxone, if any? Please select all that apply:
Don’t know; City of Wolverhampton Council do not hold this information.



