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CITYor

WOLVERHAMPTON

COUNCIL

Response to Request for Information

Reference FOI 000396

Date

30 August 2016

Troubled Families Programme

Request:

1.A)

1.B)

Please provide details of the number of families your local authority has
attached to the Troubled Families Programme for the years 2012/13, 2013/14
and 2014/15 (phase 1 of the Troubled Families Programme) where the local
discretionary filter was used as one of your criteria for attachment, compared to
the overall total.

In respect of your above question, it has been established after careful
consideration that the Council does not hold the above information in the
category you have requested as the use of the local discretionary filter was not
a requirement when claiming the attachment fee. Consequently we are
informing you as required by Section 1(1) (a) of the Act, that states:

"Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled to
be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the
description specified in the request".

However, we are able to provide figures which shows the overall attachment
payment received each year which we hope will of help to you.

2012/13 - 225
2013/14 - 338
2014/15 -113

What is the total value for these years of the attachment payments received by
your local authority where the local discretionary filter was used as one of your
criteria for attachment?

In respect of your above question, it has been established after careful
consideration that the Council does not hold the above information in the
category you have requested. Consequently, we are unable to provide the
above information broken down to specifically identify where the local
discretionary filter was used as one of the criteria for the attachment, and are
informing you as required by Section 1(1) (a) of the Act, that states:

"Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled to
be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the
description specified in the request".
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However, we are able to provide figures for 2012/14 which shows the overall
attachment payment received each year which we hope will of help to you.

2012/13 - £720,000
2013/14 - £811,000
2014/15 - £180,800

1.C) What is the total value for these years of the results payments received by your
local authority where the local discretionary filter was used as one of your
criteria for a results payment?

2012/13 — The local discretionary filter was not used as one of the criteria for
results payments

2013/14 - The local discretionary filter was not used as one of the criteria for
results payments
Nil

2014/15 — The local discretionary filter was not used as one of the criteria for
results payments
Nil

1.D) Please provide details of the local discretionary filters used across these
families (may | suggest a list).
The following 8 local discretionary criteria were used in Phase 1 of the Families
in Focus programme, to select families who met a minimum of 2 of the national
criteria for the programme and were a cause for concern:

Child at risk of Entering Care

Domestic Violence

Substance Misuse

Mental Health Issues

Family live in a Police Priority Area

At risk of sexual exploitation

Involvement in or at the edge of involvement in gangs

Child or young person in the family over the age of 8 is involved in anti-
social behaviour but has not been formally charges. (Criteria for a YISP
referral)

ONORWN =

2.A) Please provide details (may | suggest a list) of the new or different indicators
that your local authority has used to attach families to the Troubled Families
Programme (phase 2), as detailed in your Local Outcome Plans.

Please see information provided on the next page



[NOT PROTECTIVELY MARKED]
CITY or
WOLVERHAMPTOMN

COoOuUNCIL

Wolverhampton Troubled Families
Expanded Programme Outcome Plan

CITy o
WOLVERHAMIPTOMN
COUNECIL Woaolverhampton Expanded Programme Cutcome Plan
Family Prablem Strategic Goal Strategic Qutcome
2. Chilldren wiho hawe mof bean e soheweme and Fuscleme R
emucation b dribnen s
& Familles Pisn 2075 - 25
A mey ot are sarpor S of Sateguaning prIE N
e DT — Coporate wulirperainls sbusthors and
I S of mesesdl.




CITY o
WOLVERHAMIPTOM
COUNCIL

[NOT PROTECTIVELY MARKED]

Woaolverhampton Expanded Programme Cutcome Plan

PARENTS & CHILDREM INVOLVED IM CRIME OR ANTI SOCIAL BEHAVIOUR.

pravios 12 monte

P S ——
o—a st amtorzza seeae s

L Achld oryoung pimon wha b
cammited 3 paaen ofenc In T

pating Invavad In criminality

o e O In the e 12
o (Cnmawiaan wn
prenviow 12 maneha)

n  Succsmsyl comglstion o 3nMGC
(Acowomace Eeowdous ComrmeT) .

CITY o
WOLVERHAMIPTOM
COUNCIL

Woaolverhampton Expanded Programme Cutcome Plan
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Children who need help.
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Families affected by domestic violence and abuse.
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Parents and Children with a range of health problems.
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2.B) Please provide details of the number of attachments made by your local
authority in 2015/16 to the Troubled Families Programme that used these new
or different indicators, compared to overall attachments.

In response to your question | have assumed that by “attachments” you mean
the number of families that met each of the 6 headline criteria.

Please find below details of the breakdown of families meeting each of the 6
headline criteria in 2015/2016 in Year 1 of the expanded programme.

Criteria Number of Families
Parents and young people involved in crime or
anti-social behaviour 39

Children who have not been attending school

regularly 145
Children who need help 483
Adult out of work or at risk of financial exclusion and

young people at risk of worklessness 415
Families affected by domestic violence and abuse 270
Parents and children with a range of health problems 227

2.C) Please provide details of the total value of attachment payments claimed for by
your local authority in 2015/16 for the Troubled Families Programme that used
these new or different indicators, compared to overall attachment payments.
The attachment payment claimed in 2015/16 was £483,000 this matched the
overall attachment payment for the year.



