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CITY or

WOLVERHAMPTON
COUNCIL

Response to Request for Information

Reference FOI 000225
Date 21 June 2016

Residential Care and Supported Living for Adults (aged 18-
65) with Learning Disabilities.

Request:

Under the Freedom of Information Act, | would like to request the following
information regarding residential care and supported living for adults (aged 18-65)
with learning disabilities.

1. Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the
commissioner with responsibility for learning disabilities placements in
residential care?

We don't have a dedicated commissioner working specifically in this area. The
social work team work with service users living in Independent Placements.

2. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by
the Local Authority in residential care. Please supply this information as a
snapshot at the end of the year for the financial years 2013/14 to 2015/16, and
where possible, the most up to date snapshot available for 2016/177?

Year Count
2013/14 158
2014/15 172
2015/16 159
As at 153
06/07/2016

3.  Of the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the Local
Authority in residential care (q.2) please provide the number that are in ‘in area’
placements and the number that are in ‘out of area’ placements. Please supply
this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial years
2013/14 to 2015/16, and where possible, the most up to date snapshot
available for 2016/177?

Year In Area Out of Area
2013/14 94 64
2014/15 98 74
2015/16 90 69
As at 87 66

06/07/2016
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Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who transitioned
from children’s learning disabilities services into adult residential care services.
Please supply the total number that transitioned in each of the financial years
2013/14 to 2015/16, and where possible, the number that have transitioned to
date in 2016/17?

Year Count
2013/14 1
2014/15 3
2015/16 1
Up to 0
06/07/2016

Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who transitioned
from children’s learning disabilities services into adult supported living services.
Please supply the total number that transitioned in each of the financial years
2013/14 to 2015/16, and where possible, the number that have transitioned to
date in 2016/177?

Year Count
2013/14 5
2014/15 6
2015/16 4
Up to 1
06/07/2016

Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who ‘stepped
down’ from specialist inpatient hospital placements into adult residential care
services. Please supply the total number that transitioned in each of the
financial years 2013/14 to 2015/16, and where possible, the number that have
transitioned to date in 2016/177?

Information not held.

Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who ‘stepped
down’ from specialist inpatient hospital placements into adult supported living
services. Please supply the total number that transitioned in each of the
financial years 2013/14 to 2015/16, and where possible, the number that have
transitioned to date in 2016/177?

Information not held.

Please provide the local authority’s total expenditure on residential care for
adults with learning disabilities for each of the financial years 2013/14 to
2015/16, and where possible, budgeted expenditure for 2016/17. If expenditure
for 2015/16 is not yet available, please provide projected expenditure?
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£'s Gross expenditure
(excludes contributions
Year from clients & health)
2013/14 local
authority
expenditure 11,632,843
2014/15 local
authority
expenditure 12,654,442
2015/16 local
authority
expenditure 12,381,651
2016/17 local
authority
budget 10,822,930




